

**BID RESULT FORM  
CITY OF DANBURY**

**Bid #8-22-23-04 "Plow Blades & Related Hardware – Highway"**

**Bid Date: Thursday, September 8, 2022**

**10:00 A.M.**

Bidder →	East Coast Sign & Supply, Inc.	Valk Manufacturing Company	Eastern Wear Parts
<b>Steel Plow Blades Everest</b>			
1. Standard Highway Punch 11'x6"x3/4'	\$3,600.00	\$3,060.00	\$3,902.60
2. Curb Guard: Right	\$1,300.00	No Bid	\$4,061.00
3..Blade Protector	\$760.00	No Bid	\$3,077.80
<b>Polarflex Carbide Segmented Plow Blades</b>			
4. 6 ft. Front Mount Complete System	\$5,880.00	No Bid	\$5,520.00
5. 5 ft. Front Mount Complete System	\$4,900.00	No Bid	\$4,600.00
Lump Sum Total	\$16,440.00	\$3,060.00	\$17,258.80
Vendor will honor prices for additional orders during 2022-2023 winter season	Yes	No	Yes
If yes Min. Purchase Req.	\$2,500.00	\$3,000.00	No Minimum
Delivery within	14-21 days	14	21

Attending: C. Volpe, B. Schlemmer

Awards Committee Initials  
Finance Director:  
Corporation Counsel:  
Department Head:  
why it is not acceptable.

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

Tax Office \_\_\_\_\_  
DATE

Purchasing Agent \_\_\_\_\_  
DATE