

**BID RESULT FORM
CITY OF DANBURY**

Bid #08-22-23-01 "Hi-Way Spreader Parts"

Bid Date: Thursday, Sept. 1, 2021

10:00 A.M.

Bidder→	East Coast Sign & Supply Inc.	
	OEM- Hi-Way Parts	Non-OEM -Hi-Way Parts
Item 1. 6465 Bearing	\$420.00	NO BID
Item 2. 2121 Idler Bearing	\$860.00	NO BID
Item 3. 39582 Shaft	\$265.00	NO BID
Item 4. 6131 Key	\$24.00	NO BID
Item 5. 37010 Key	\$14.00	NO BID
Item 6. 12993 Chain	\$4,750.00	NO BID
Item 7. 86437 Shaft	\$2,275.00	NO BID
Item 8. 21118 Pin	\$120.00	NO BID
Item 9. 71241 Bearing Kit	\$2,950.00	NO BID
Item 10. 22511 Take-up Bearing	\$340.00	NO BID
Item 11. 36671 Gear Box	\$1,100.00	NO BID
Item 12. 27275 Sprockets Drive 2"	\$2,650.00	NO BID
Item 13. 3908 Nut Take Up Tightener	\$400.00	NO BID
Item 14. 14382 Jack Handle	\$550.00	NO BID
Item 15. 85002 U Joint	\$1,400.00	NO BID
Item 16. 2242 HUB	\$1,250.00	NO BID
Item 17. 667x21 1/4 to C3/8 x 1 1/7 21' Chain	\$3,800.00	NO BID
LUMP SUM TOTAL	\$23,168.00	NO BID
Guaranteed delivery	5-7 days	NO BID
Add'l OEM Hi-Way items - % off list (delivered)	0%	NO BID

Attending: B. Schlemmer, D. Natale

Awards Committee Initial

Finance Director:
Corporation Counsel:
Department Head:
why it is not acceptable.
AWARDED TO:

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons

Tax Office _____ Purchasing Agent _____
DATE DATE