

**BID RESULT FORM**  
City of Danbury

Bid #04-21-22-02 "Chemicals -- Water Department"

Bid Date: Tuesday, May 17, 2022

10:00 A.M.

Bidder	Item 1. Sulfate of Alumina Unit Price	Item 2. Hydrofluosilicic Acid Unit Price	Item 3. Copper Sulfate Unit Price	Item 4. Sodium Hydroxide Unit Price	Item 5. Sodium Hypochoirite Unit Price	Item 6. Orthophosphoric Acid Unit Price	Item 7. Potassium Permanganate Unit Price	LUMP SUM TOTAL
Slack Chemical Co., Inc.	NO BID	\$0.609	NO BID	0.244	0.174	NO BID	NO BID	\$385,940.00
Carus LLC	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.12	NO BID	\$78,400.00
Holland	\$0.141	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$310,200.00
Chemtrade	\$0.1137 *	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$250,140.00
Kemira Water Solutions	\$0.142	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$312,400.00
Chemrite, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	\$161.50/bag	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.98/lb.	\$144.95/pail	\$92,870.00
Harcos Chemicals Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	\$117.69/bag	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.4198/lb.	\$137,048.40
Univar Solutions	NO BID	\$2.559	NO BID	\$-1.606	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.82	\$212,202.00
Vineera Chemicals, LLC	NO BID	NO BID	\$129.00/bag	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$129,000.00
Shannon Chemical Corporation	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.44 /#	\$3.34 /#	\$127,520.00
Amrex Chemical Co., Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	\$139.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$139,000.00
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$-1.737 **	\$2276 **	NO BID	NO BID	\$279,773.00
Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.1994/wet lb.	\$0.171 /wet lb.	NO BID	NO BID	\$271,516.00
Brenntag Northeast, LLC.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.36 per lb.	\$18,880.00
Surpass Chemical Co. Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4425	\$378	NO BID	\$135.58	\$621,405.00
Usalco	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Pencco, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Attending: B. Schlemmer, D. Natale \* See Proposals

Awards Committee Initials:  
Finance Director:  
Corporation Counsel:  
Department Head:

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons why it is not acceptable.

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

Tax Office \_\_\_\_\_

Purchasing Agent \_\_\_\_\_

DATE

DATE