

**BID RESULT FORM
CITY OF DANBURY**

10/2

Bid #03-20-21-07 "Pipe Materials-- Public Utilities
Bid Date: Thursday, April 15, 2021

10:00 A.M.

Bidder→	E.J. Prescott	Core & Main LP	FW Webb Company	Ti-Sales	Ferguson Waterworks, LLC
1. Smith Blair 317-076009-000 6"x1" CC Saddle Epoxy w/304SS Straps QTY. 40 Total Cost	\$2,644.40	\$2,440.00	No Bid	\$5,619.20	\$2,375.60
2. 6" Mega-Lug Gland pack w/304 SS Tbolts, nuts & Gasket QTY. 35 Total Cost	\$ 4,577.65	\$4,292.40	\$1,520.75	\$1,659.00	\$4,511.85
3. 1" x 100 Type K Cooper Roll QTY. 6 rolls Total Cost	\$3,588.00	\$3,744.00 *	\$3,787.56	No Bid	\$3,367.80
4. 1" CC x Compression Ball Corp (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 40 Total Cost	\$2,489.20	\$2,538.80	\$3032.00	\$3,272.40	\$2,435.20
5. 1" Compression Curb Stop (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 40 Total Cost	\$3,895.60	\$4,108.80	\$4,745.20	\$5,120.80	\$3,941.20
6. 1" x 3/4" Compression Union (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 30 Total Cost	\$622.80	\$623.40	\$758.40	\$818.40	\$597.60
7. 1" x 1" Compression Tee QTY. 20 Total Cost	\$924.60	\$1,201.40	\$1,126.40	\$1,216.00	\$1,140.00
8. 6" Open Left Ductile Iron, Stainless Hardware, Epoxy Valve (Domestic) Kennedy or Mueller QTY. 8 Total Cost	\$4,904.64	\$4,023.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,900.80
9. 8" Open Left Ductile Iron, Stainless Hardware, Epoxy Valve (Domestic) Kennedy or Mueller	\$3,905.88	\$3,204.44	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,106.36
10. 1" CTS Plastic Pipe	\$360.00	\$456.00	\$304.00	No Bid	\$304.80
11. 1" Stainless stiffeners for CTS Plastic Pipe	\$141.00	\$255.00	\$135.00	\$145.50	\$156.00
BID TOTAL	\$28,053.77	\$26,888.16	\$	\$17,851.30	\$25,837.21
Guaranteed Delivery	14 Days	28-56 days	30 days	Stock to 2 weeks	14 days
Prices valid for --- days	60 Days	365	60 days	60 days	30 days

Bidder→	G&L Water Works Supply Corp.	Superior Products Distributors, Inc.	Stiles Company Inc.
---------	------------------------------	--------------------------------------	---------------------

**BID RESULT FORM
CITY OF DANBURY**

2 of 2

Bid #03-20-21-07 "Pipe Materials-- Public Utilities
Bid Date: Thursday, April 15, 2021

10:00 A.M.

1. Smith Blair 317-076009-000 6"x1" CC Saddle Epoxy w/304SS Straps QTY. 40 Cost	Total	\$2,316.00	\$2,870.80	No Bid
2. 6" Mega-Lug Gland pack w/304 SS Tbolts, nuts & Gasket QTY. 35	Total Cost	\$ 3,330.25	\$1,978.90	No Bid
3. 1" x 100 Type K Cooper Roll QTY. 6 rolls	Total Cost	\$3,522.00	\$3,756.00	\$3,936.00
4. 1" CC x Compression Ball Corp (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 40	Total Cost	\$2,374.00	\$2,174.40	\$2,432.00
5. 1" Compression Curb Stop (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 40	Total Cost	\$3,718.00	\$4,375.60	\$3,805.20
6. 1" x 3/4" Compression Union (no lead) (Domestic) QTY. 30	Total Cost	\$594.00	\$699.30	\$624.60
7. 1" x 1" Compression Tee QTY. 20	Total Cost	\$915.00	\$1,038.60	\$903.60
8. 6" Open Left Ductile Iron, Stainless Hardware, Epoxy Valve (Domestic) Kennedy or Mueller QTY. 8	Total Cost	\$3,896.80	\$4,234.40	No Bid
9. 8" Open Left Ductile Iron, Stainless Hardware, Epoxy Valve (Domestic) Kennedy or Mueller		\$3,103.20	\$3,372.12	No Bid
10. 1" CTS Plastic Pipe		\$376.00	\$282.40	1,280.00
11. 1" Stainless stiffeners for CTS Plastic Pipe		\$112.50	\$141.00	\$108.00
BID TOTAL		\$24,257.75	\$24,923.52	\$13,089.40
Guaranteed Delivery		14 Days	30 Days	Within 10 days
Prices valid for --- days		30 Days *	90 Days	365 days

Attending: B. Schlemmer, D. Natale * see Proposals

Awards Committee Initial

Finance Director
Corporation Counsel
Department Head
why it is not acceptable.
AWARDED TO:

Comments: Awards Committee

If low bid is not bid of award, please specify reasons

Tax Office _____

Purchasing Agent _____

DATE

DATE