DANBURY, CONNECTICUT 06819

ALAN D, BAKER, CHIEF
" TERENCE M., SHANAHAN, DEPUTY CHIEF
(203) 797-4614

DEPARTMENT OF POLICE
375 MAIN STREET

April 16, 2014

MEMORANDUM

To: Members of the City Council
Mayor Mark D. Boughton

From: Alan D. Baker, (ihief of Police

Subject: Request to Accept Donation

Permission is requested to accept a grant donation of $2,000.00 from the Connecticut
Police Work Dog Association (CPWDA). Our K-9 Unit has compiled a list of equipment
and supplies needed, to be submitted to the CPWDA, which will in turn purchase the
items, upon approval by the Council. All materials will be beneficial to the K-9 Program
and enable both of our canines, Zeke and Koda, to better serve the community.

Lo & (8

Alan D, Baker
Chief of Police

ADB:mrl
Attach.

ce: David St. Hilaire — Finance

RECYCLED
PAPER




Danbury Police Department K-9 Unit Equipment Request:

Ray Allen (www.rayallen.com)

1)

2)

3)

4)

Dogtra Advance E Collar One Dog Unit {Item # DC2300NCP} Quantity: 1, Price:$299.99

Tac-Black Leather Padded Tracking Harness (item # TH-2-L-BLA) Quantity: 1, Price:
$79.99

Leather Gauntlet Latigo Leather {item # 61-800-P) Quantity: 1, Price: $19.99
GoughNuts Stick (item # GNO2), Quantity: 3, Price Each: $26.99, x2: $80.97
Total: $453.95

Estimated Shipping: $25.00

Grand Total From Ray Allen: $505.94

Elite K9 {www.elitek9.com)

1)

2)

6)

7)
8)

9)

K9 Tactical Field Kit {ltem # FO30) Quantity: 1, Price: $289.95
Jute Bite Pillow (item # TJP) Quantity: 2, Price Each: $34.95, x2: $69.90
Agitation Stick (ltem # W04} Quantity: 1, Price: §21.95

Firehose Tug 12” 2 Handle 3 Wide (Item # TF12 23) Quantity: 4, Price Each: $14.95,
x4:559.80

Tactical Patro! Harness w/ Cobra Buckle, black (item # MHO16) Price Each: $59.95,
x2:5119.90

K-9 Unit Silver Reflective 4” x 2” Velcro ID Pane! Black Letters on Silver Reflective Panel,
(item # ID420) Quantity: 4, Price Each: $6.95, x4: $27.80

Guardian K9 Light Red (item # A210) Quantity: 1, Price: $14.95
13 Quart Stainless Steel Pail {Item # K06) Quantity: 1, Price: $29.95

Spill Proof Buddy Bow/, clear (Iltem # K01} Quantity: 1, Price $16.95



10) “Danger Off Limits Police Working Dog Area” sign (item # SN35) Quantity: 1, Price
$16.95

Total: $668.10
Estimated Shipping: $25.28

Grand Total From Elite K9: $693.38

Hallmark K9 (1-800-767-9055)
1) Farbo Leather Scratch Pants, Quantity: 1, Price: $450.00

http://www.hallmarkk9.com/fraboscratchpants.aspx

Size: Large (states need to call to order}
Estimated Shipping: $11.76
Grand Total From Hallmak K9: $461.76
Leerburg (Leerburg.com) (under working dog, bite work gear}

1) Lace Up Hidden Sleeve {Product # 1362) Quantity: 1, Price: $138.00

2) Reinforced Synthetic Leg Sleeve (Product # JX061) Quantity: 1, Price $185.00
Total:$323.00
Estimated Shipping: $4.99 (flat rate discount as of 02/20/14)
Grand Total From Leerburg: $327.99

Grand Total For All Requested ltems With Shipping: $1,989.07

Thank You For Your Consideration,

DPD K9 Unit




City of ﬁanbury, CT Mail - Fwd: CPWDA K-9 Equipment Request Dttps://mail google.conymail/?7ui=2 &il=3 50038738 &view=pt&rsear...

Misti Leonard <m.leonard@danbury-ct.gov>

Fwd: CPWDA K-9 Equipment Request

1 message

Alan Baker <a.baker@danbury-ct.gov> Wed, Apr 16, 2014 at 8:28 AM
To: Misti Leonard <m.leonard@danbury-ct.gov>
Please prepare a letter to the council, requesting permission to accept a $2k grant from the Connecticut
Police Work Dog Association (CPWDA). CPWDA will make the actual purchase and donate the items to the

DPD. ltemized list atiached - other info below about the organization..

Al B

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: James Antonelli <j.antonelli@danbtiry-ct.gov>
Date: Tue, Apr 15, 2014 at 11:53 AM

Subject: Re: CPWDA K-9 Equipment Request

To: Alan Baker <a.baker@danbury-ct,gov>

Chief,
Sorry | just realized | never sent you the information for the Connecticut Police Work Dog Association

$2,000 grant we were awarded for City Council Approval. The information is as follows:

Connecticut Police Work Dog Association
James A Cortina, Treasurer

596 Vauxhall St. Ext.

Waterford, CT 06385

President: Rosario Savastra (Detective West Hardford PD)

The below information is the email | received for the departments that were awarded the grants, the
equipment we requested is in the first email | sent you in this sequence. Please let me know if you need

anything else. Thank you.

Jim

Copy of Emaill | received:

Brothers and Sisters,

As previously explained in Secretary Kempke's email, the $2,000 grants were awarded to Danbury, Startford,
Willimantic and New Milford. 1 would ask that your itemized list; including place of purchase, items to be
purchased, cost and item numbers be emailed to Cortina. | received hard copies, some of which were incomplete
or being altered, therefore this is the quickest and easiest way to get your items to you. This would also be the
time to alter your list if you decided on a different company, model or K9 item you wanted on your list. Please
make sure your items reach the $2,000 mark. You get a full 52,000 so don't sell vourself short with equipment. {f
your bill goes over $2,000, just send a check for the remaining amount over 52,000 to Cortina. Once Cortina
receives your itemized list, Cortina will order the items, pay for them and have them sent to your agency.

4/16/2014 8:34 AM
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